kl

MUNICIPAL COUNCIL AGENDA
TEMPORARY CITY HALL " e
141 OAK STREET, TAUNTON, MA 02780 - - =

MAY 24, 2016 — 7:00 PM - =

INVOCATION

ROLL CALL

RECORDS

HEARING: On the petition of the Ghazi Fadlallah, 91-93 Green Street,

Rockland, MA 02370 for:

A new Class II License, Rt. 138 Auto Center, Inc. to be
located at 182 Broadway, Taunton.

HEARING: On the petition of the George Antoun, 1151 Washington St. Apt. 1,

Norwood, MA 02062 for:

A new Class II License, Taunton Tire & Auto Service, Inc.
to be located at 491 West Water Street, Taunton.

COMMUNICATIONS FROM THE MAYOR
o Presentation of the FY17 Budget

APPOINTMENTS

COMMUNICATIONS FROM CITY OFFICERS

Pg. 1-3 Com. from Assistant City Solicitor —Ordinance Section 8-27 Illegal
Dumping — Amount of Fine and Ordinance Section 12-78 Hawkers and
Peddlers (typographical error)

Pg. 4-5 Com. from City Solicitor — Auction of Tax Possession Properties
COMMUNICATIONS FROM CITIZENS

PETITIONS

COMMITTEE REPORTS

UNFINISHED BUSINESS



ORDERS, ORDINANCES AND RESOLUTIONS

Ordinance for a first reading to be passed to a second reading

AN ORDINANCE
Chapter 8

Garbage, Trash and Refuse
Article I

Section 8-27. Illegal dumping; penalty for same.

Be it ordained by the Municipal Council of the City of Taunton and by authority of the
same as follows:

SECTION 1. The second sentence of Section 8-27, Chapter 8, of the Revised
Ordinances of the City of Taunton, as appearing, is hereby amended by striking the

phrase “seven hundred dollars ($700)” and replacing same with “three hundred
dollars ($300)”

SECTION 2. All ordinances or parts thereof inconsistent herewith are hereby
repealed. This Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon passage.

Ordinance for a first reading to be passed to a second reading

AN ORDINANCE
Chapter 12
Licenses and Miscellaneous Business Regulations
Article V. Hawkers and Peddlers
Section 12-78 Licenses required for soliciting money or selling goods

Be it ordained by the Municipal Council of the City of Taunton and by authority of the
same as follows:

SECTION 1. In order to correct a typographical error, Chapter 12, Section 12-78

of the Revised Ordinances of the City of Taunton, as amended, is hereby further
amended as follows:

1. Delete the words “corn mission” and replace with “commission”.

SECTION 2. This Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon passage.



NEW BUSINESS

Respectfully submitted,

@%M/%&!&;
Rose Marie Blackwell
City Clerk



City of Taunton
LAW DEPARTMENT
141 Oak Street
Taunton, Massachusetts 02780
Phone (508) 821-1036 Facsimile (508) 821-1397

Thomas C. Hoye, Jr. Jason D. Buffington
MAYOR CITY SOLICITOR

Daniel F. de Abreu
ASST. CITY SOLICITOR

May 18, 2016

Jeanne M. Quinn, President
Taunton Municipal Council
141 Oak Street _
Taunton, MA 02780

RE:  Ordinance Section 8-27 Illegal Dumping — Amount of Fine
Dear Council President Quinn:

Please see herewith a draft of an ordinance that changes the amount of the fine for illegal
dumping to $300, which is the maximum permitted by statute. Also, please see herewith a draft
of an ordinance to correct a typographical error. These changes were approved by the committee
on ordinances, and the full council adopted the recommendation, on October 21, 2014. They
were not enacted at that time. Will you please cause each ordinance to be moved for a first
reading, assuming that the Council still deems it appropriate.

Thank you.
Respectfully,
|
Daniel F. de Abreu
Assistant City Solicitor
DFD/smyv
Enclosure

cc: Jason D. Buffington, City Solicitor



CITY, OF TAUNTON
In the year two thousand and sixteen
AN ORDINANCE
Chapter 8

Garbage, Trash and Refuse
Article ||

Section 8-27. lllegal dumping; penalty for same.

Be it ordained by the Municipal Council of the City of Taunton and by authority of the same as follows:

SECTION 1. The second sentence of Section 8-27, Chapter 8, of the Revised Ordinances
of the City of Taunton, as appearing, is hereby amended by striking the phrase “seven
hundred dollars ($700)” and replacing same with “three hundred dollars ($300)”

SECTION 2. All ordinances or parts thereof inconsistent herewith are hereby repealed.
This Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon passage.

City of Taunton Presented to the Mayor and Approved:
In Municipal Council

First Reading:

Thomas C. Hoye, Mayor
Second Reading:

Passed to be Ordained: Approved as to Form and Character:

Rose Marie Blackwell, City Clerk Jason D. Buffington, City Solicitor



CITY OF TAUNTON
In the year two thousand and sixteen

AN ORDINANCE
Chapter 12
Licenses and Miscellaneous Business Regulations
Article V. Hawkers and Peddlers

Section 12-78 Licenses required for soliciting money or selling goods

Be it ordained by the Municipal Council of the City of Taunton and by authority of the same as follows:

SECTION 1. In order to correct a typographical error, Chapter 12, Section 12-78 of the
Revised Ordinances of the City of Taunton, as amended, is hereby further amended as
follows:

1. Delete the words “corn mission” and replace with “comimission

LE]
s

SECTION 2. This Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon passage.

City of Taunton Presented to the Mayor and Approved:
In Municipal Council

First Reading:

Thomas C. Hoye, Mayor
Second Reading:

Passed to be Ordained: Approved as to Form and Character:

Rose Marie Blackwell, City Clerk Jason D. Buffington, City Solicitor



Ll
City of Taunton | /
LAW DEPARTMENT

141 Qak Street
Taunton, Massachusetts 02780
Phone (508) 821-1036 Facsimile (508) 821-1397

Jason D. Buffington
CITY SOLICITOR

Thomas C. Hoye, Ir,
MAYOR

May 20, 2016 )
Daniel F. de Abreu
ASST. CITY SOLICITOR

Honorable Mayor Thomas C. Hoye, Jr.
Members of the Taunton Municipal Council
141 Oak Street

Taunton, MA 02780

RE:  Auction of Tax Possession Properties

Dear Mayor Hoye and Members of the Municipal Council:

Please be advised that pursuant to MGL, Chapter 60, Section 77B, the Tax Possession
Custodian will be holding a series of public auctions of tax possession properties. On
Wednesday, June 22, 2016 at 6:00 p.m. at Temporary City Hall, an auction will be conducted for
the following parcels:

40 Pratt Street Map 106, Lot 151

13 Plain Street Map 92, Lot 212

17 Barnum Street Map 78, Lot 39

430 Winthrop Street (2 lots) Map 89, Lot 161 and Map 89, Lot 160

4 & 6 High Street Ext. Map 78, Lot 150 and Map 78, Lot 148

In addition, on the same date and time, the Treasurer’s office will auction off the
following land of low value parcels:

Hart Street Map 93, Lot 120 56 Camara Street Map 96, Lot 50
Bedford Street Map 46, Lot 260 Jardin Street Map 96, Lot 41
Greylock Avenue ~ Map 64, Lot 37 Old Colony Ave Map 96, Lot 42
Greylock Avenue ~ Map 64, Lot 40 Silver Street Map 77, Lot 523
Pinehill Street Map 109, Lot 25 Power Street Map 68, Lot 307
Power Street Map 68, Lot 309 Power Street Map 68, Lot 308



Thank you for your attention to this matter.

Very truly yours,

/skb



MAY 24, 2016

HONORABLE THOMAS C. HOYE, JR., MAYOR
COUNCIL PRESIDENT JEANNE M. QUINN
AND MEMBERS OF THE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL

THE FOLLOWING COMMITTEE MEETINGS HAVE BEEN SCHEDULED FOR
TUESDAY, MAY 24, 2016 AT 5:30 P.M. AT THE TEMPORARY CITY HALL AT
MAXHAM SCHOOL, 141 OAK STREET, TAUNTON, MA. 02780, IN THE
CHESTER R. MARTIN MUNICIPAL COUNCIL CHAMBERS

PLEASE NOTE:

5:30 P.M. THE COMMITTEE ON FINANCE & SALARIES
1. MEET TO REVIEW THE WEEKLY VOUCHERS & PAYROLLS FOR CITY

DEPARTMENTS ‘
2 MEET TO REVIEW REQUESTS FOR FUNDING

3. MEET TO REVIEW MATTERS IN FILE

A “MEETING” OF THE ENTIRE MUNICIPAL COUNCIL, AS SAID TERM IS

PLEASE NOTE:
DEFINED IN MASS. GEN. L. C. 304, §18 MAY OCCUR CONCURRENTLY WITH

THIS COMMITTEE MEETING

RESPECTFULLY,
Lo . COLLEEN M. ELLIS
‘ CLERK OF COUNCIL COMMITTEES



